



**Snohomish
County
Purchasing Division**

M/S #507
3000 Rockefeller Avenue
Everett, WA 98201-4046

(425) 388-3344
FAX (425) 388-3931

CONTRACT AWARD INFORMATION

SOLICITATION NUMBER	TITLE	DUE DATE	STATUS
007-14	Ergonomic Chairs, District Court	May 13, 2014	Awarded
DATE AWARDED	AWARDEE	AWARD AMOUNT	
June 12, 2014	WorkPointe	\$24,340.68	

BID No.007-14		Product/Service: Ergonomic Chairs, District Court																				
Opening Date: 05/13/2014		Department: District Court																				
ITEM NO.	Quantity	DESCRIPTION	ATD America		Work Pointe		Complete Office Solutions		Outsmart Office Solutions		Office Max		Metrospace Design Group		Quantum		Creative Office		Ebony Office Interiors		Keeney's Office Supplies	
			Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
1	47	Chair, with arms, Strata #1565-Y2-A9B, carpet casters, black frame, black mesh back, Grade A air mesh seat colors Dark Blue 104, burgundy 106 or black.	\$222.19	\$ 10,442.93	\$ 349.79	\$ 16,440.13	\$ 264.00	\$ 12,408.00	\$ 936.96	\$ 44,037.12	\$ 936.96	\$ 44,037.12	\$ 349.79	\$ 16,440.13	\$ 329.00	\$ 15,463.00	\$ 335.00	\$ 15,745.00	\$ 990.00	\$ 29,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
2	1	Stool, with arms, Strata Mod. 1566-Y2-A9B, carpet casters, black frame, black mesh back, Grade A air mesh seat color black.	\$272.57	\$ 272.57	\$ 399.50	\$ 399.50	\$ 303.00	\$ 303.00	\$ 1,227.73	\$ 1,227.73	\$1,227.73	\$ 1,227.73	\$ 399.50	\$ 399.50	\$ 363.00	\$ 363.00	\$ 299.00	\$ 299.00	#####	\$ 6,450.00	No Bid	No Bid
3	20	Chair, with arms, Vault Mod. #1460-Y3-A9B, carpet casters, black frame, M2 back mesh colors, black air mesh seat.	\$198.80	\$ 3,976.00	\$ 273.00	\$ 5,460.00	\$ 215.00	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 104.37	\$ 2,087.40	\$ 104.37	\$ 2,087.40	\$ 273.50	\$ 5,470.00	\$ 329.00	\$ 6,580.00	\$ 309.00	\$ 6,180.00	\$ 128.00	\$ 3,840.00	No Bid	No Bid
4	7	Chair, without arms, Vault Mod. 1460-Y3-A00, carpet casters, black frame, M2 back mesh colors, black air mesh seat, or comparable item. No aerosol type.	\$198.80	\$ 1,391.60	\$ 93.49	\$ 654.43	\$ 178.00	\$ 1,246.00	\$ 96.35	\$ 674.45	\$ 96.35	\$ 674.45	\$ 229.69	\$ 1,607.83	\$ 268.00	\$ 1,876.00	\$ 296.00	\$ 2,072.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 500.00	No Bid	No Bid
5	13	Chair, Sitwell Elevate Mod. #E35, carpet casters, adjustable height arms/with sliding/swivel pad, sychro-tilt mechanism, seat slide, black frame, seat and back Grade 2 301-004 or 301-006 or Grade 1 298-011.	\$284.74	\$ 3,701.62	\$ 31.10	\$ 404.30	\$ 371.00	\$ 4,823.00	\$ 32.13	\$ 417.69	\$ 32.13	\$ 417.69	\$ 433.99	\$ 5,641.87	\$ 435.00	\$ 5,655.00	\$ 448.00	\$ 5,824.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 1,330.00	\$ 412.51	\$ 5,362.63
Sub-total			\$ 19,784.72		\$ 23,358.36		\$ 23,080.00		\$ 48,444.39		\$ 48,444.39		\$ 29,559.33		\$ 29,937.00		\$ 30,120.00		\$ 41,820.00		\$ 5,362.63	